IS Fo Elo TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

STHTTUT
EXTRAORDINARY
9T [[—EUE 3—3U-WUe (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

IRt | WehTToTd
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
9, 80] =g facett, Sgwfaar, W&t 2, 2017 /919 13, 1938
No. 80] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY FEBRUARY 2, 2017/MAGHA 13, 1938

TTEY SR IRETR Fe AT HTT
(FaTeT ST aaTe Feamor fawmT)

SfeET
T feeett, 2 wa, 2017

ar.HT1.fA. 103(31).—=iofer iz yoree ARl R, 1945 &7 37 Fomree w5 % foro wfaa
R et 7 IT=T frfer sfi¥ TaTee Gt Afafa=m, 1940 (1940 T 23) Fir €T 12 ¥ grer 33 &
FULATIHTY. T 6 TSI, FETIR, 90 11, &< 3, SUEs (i), a5 AT, 2016 & Jarfera
AT TLHIT 6 qTeed 3T TR FHedT00 §A1AT (FATET 3T TRATT FHeAT0T [&F9RT) i rag=-r
. 91.FLM. 667(3), TG 5 JATs, 2016 FTT THTTT 63T AT o7 56 g7 39 a9t A =RAT 9,

oTeeh SHH TATET g il FATEAT 8, I g o, Rl I ATSEAAT a7l AT o ToT97T l
ST STHAT 1 IaeTse HXT af T2 o, Fqreiie & st srafer &t q91ie & 99 nefd o =179 A q

e T o,
ST ITH TSI Al TTAAT STAAT &l A@ 5 JATs, 2016 HT ITAse F4T & e o |

ST Fea T AT G I<h AT 6 Gael | S9ar § I7 ey ofiT gAmar a7 fG=m
TATE |

qAq:, AT, FealT GLHRL, AT T AT TTHIAT Afata=w, 1940 (1940 71 23) FT &mer 12
ST gTeT 33 % eI AT T TART Fd g, STTEN Thet ol TATGRTL AT F TIHI FA o6 THT,

sirfer ofie srEmee aTat FaH, 1945 F7 {7 Herg #i3d & foru Aetated [{aw aardt g, steid;-
1. (1) = 7=t 7 "fers AT sirofer i Jomee gy (St "eras) =, 2017 21
(2) T TSI | THRTI 6T ATE Dl TG g |

581 GI/2017 )]



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART ITI—SEC. 3(i)]

2. sirafer oY sETee arRit Faw, 1945 (B2 28H 8% T4Tq S (RIH &gl @7 7) & &I
36 & T Mwferfad e sia:eafud o Srom, srai:-

“36%F. Td ETATA GIRT @A 6 (a7 ASTEFT FT a7 — (1) BT 9F sreaarer grer
ITH AEAATA | URMET 6 ITATE 6 TATST & (70 IEa=T TTH STEAT 1 T JIAT T SAATT
TR ST oI 9T o STt TR T o & S0 |

(2) UF a9 AT I ATAF o AATAT 9oF Sad qTel SOTEAT <97 § ramq & forw
Tt Tei g & Ao & forw sTaTa Jg! it STrustr |7 |
3. 3 fAuHl & Faw 45 % sufa=m (1) #, ‘=7 39l F A T5qd SO A5E1 F T 9%
fRerferferd ersg sl 92=gqe Ta@t STTua, S9iq;-

‘= Tl % ST ETe A F 9T & 91e G A sty faw weqa o

e STei fafafde sty & fiaw T3 &1 9Xre A7 [Fedwor FIAT1 §99 7 I, qg7 Rl
faresrs TE wireor a7 faserwor # O & AfAfde R 30 gu avar & 999 9gr0 S A s
FT N
4. I At & e 91 #, 9T # T aTE T UF U 9Teal & T 9G¥ “|Tr A
T T 1 T 9rex T [0 |

5. 3 fraat % R 1245 =7 < T ST

6. I Rl T ST -
(F) T&T 11 % 27 3 |, “Ush 9 9Tsal & A9 UL “qF T 9768 1@ ST0;
(@) T=T 29 F 937 3 § “Ush 0" 9Teal & €A I “d9 a9 9768 T& ST0 |

[T, ¥. TF.-1035/288/2015-TTHeFge1]
e 1ol 9T, HIeh AT

feequr: g Fem, aa F a9 | SfeeEAr 9. uE. 28-10/45-t (1), A 21 fTEeay, 1945
T THIAT BT 0 o & 398 faq e Afeg=-r €. araM. 76(1), ara
31 St 2017, g1 TaTrerg foham = o |

MINISTRY OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE
(Department of Health and Family Welfare)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 2nd February, 2017

G.S.R. 103(E).—Whereas a draft of certain rules further to amend the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945 was
published as required by section 12 and section 33 of the Drugs and Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of 1940) vide notification
of the Government of India in the Ministry of Health and Family Welfare (Department of Health and Family Welfare)
number G.S.R. 667 (E), dated the 5th July, 2016, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3,
Sub-section (i), dated the 5th July, 2016, inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby
before the expiry of a period of forty five days from the date on which the copies of the Official Gazette containing the
said notification were made available to the public;




[9M I-EvE 3(i)] A <hT TSI ¢ STHIYROT 3

And whereas copies of the Gazette were made available to the public on 5th July, 2016;

And whereas objections and suggestions received from the public on the said rules have been
considered by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred under section 12 and section 33 of the Drugs and
Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of 1940), the Central Government after consultation with the Drugs Technical
Advisory Board, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945,
namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Drugs and Cosmetics (4™ Amendment) Rules, 2017.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), after rule 36, the following
rule shall be inserted, namely:-

“36A Import of drugs by charitable hospital free of cost.—(1) Small quantity of drugs received in donation by a
charitable hospital for the purpose of treatment of the patients in the said hospital may be imported provided the
drugs are given or administered to the patients free of cost.

(2) The drugs shall not be prohibited for import and permitted to be marketed in the country with residual shelf
life of one year or more.”

3. In the said rules, in rule 45, in sub-rule (1), after the words “in accordance with these rules”, the following words
and the proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“within a period of sixty days of the receipt of the sample:

Provided that where it is not possible to test or analyse the sample within the specified period, the Government
Analyst shall seek extension of time from the Government giving specific reasons for delay in such testing or
analysis.”;

4. In the said rules, in rule 91, for the words “one year from the date of issue”, the words “three years from the date of
issue” shall be substituted.

5. In the said rules, rule 124 A shall be omitted.
6. In the said rules, in Schedule A,
(a) in Form 11, in paragraph 3, for the words, “one year”, the words “three years” shall be substituted;
(b)  in Form 29, in paragraph 3, for the words “one year”, the words “three years” shall be substituted.
[F. No. X.-11035/288/2015-DFQC]
K. L. SHARMA, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal rules were published in the Official Gazette vide notification number F. 28-10/45-H (1), dated the
21st December, 1945 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R. 76(E) dated the 31st January, 2017.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. Digitally signed
ALOK by ALOK KUMAR

Date: 2017.02.07
KU MAR 13:33:29 +05'30'



